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Section 2.1 - Anslog & Digital Vehicular ehicular-mounted mobile . U, and 700/300 Wiz trunked tional, WEBLINKS
136-174MHz mobile (Low Tier) [F5011 51 asa00| sou| sarso] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A_[2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz mobile (Mid Tier) | F5021 66 USA sav300[ sow| sze210] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz IDAS mobile (Mid Tier) | F5061D 1500[  30%| ssos0] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
135 HM-248T included (Mid Tier) | FS061D RR 7500 30| se1as0|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz IDAS mobile (Mid Tier) | F51210 5000 30| sassoo| /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz, 9.6k/4.8kbps, 25W, RS232 + ethernet (Mid Tier) | F51220D 12 00.0¢ 30%) 0. N/A No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|2-vears from date of purchase Not offered at this time.
136-174MHz IDAS mobile (Mid Ter) | F52200 7500 3| sazaso|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
36 with color display (Hiah Tier) | F5400D 01 os000[  30%|  sos6.00]  32%|  S666.40] No-n/A /A /A N/A | 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136 b (Hiah Tier | F5400D5 11 oa000]  30%| sessoo] 3 639.20( No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400 w Tier) | FE011 51 3sa00[ sox| sarso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
00 i Tier) | FE021 51 sav300[ sow| sze210] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
4 Tier [ F6021 52 sav300[ sow| saea10] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MHz IDAS mobie (Mid Tier) | F6061D 61 1500 30%| ss70 WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450.512MHz IDAS mobile (Mid Tier) | F6061D 66 1500 30%| ssos0] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450.512MHe IDAS mobile (Mid Tier) | 61210 68 5000 30| sassoo| /A No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
'400-470MHz IDAS mobile (Mid Tier) | F6220D 11 7500 3| sazaso|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
380 Tier | F6400D 01 os000[  30%|  sos6.00]  32%|  S666.40] No-n/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
Tier | F6400D 21 os000[  30%|  Sess.00]  32%|  S666.40] No-n/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
380-470MHe IDA: play (Hiah Tier) | F6400DS 11 o000]  30%|  sessoo]  32%|  $6390] No-na /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
T36-17aMHz Tier)[£7510 S172000]  30%| S1204.00] 32%| S1.169.60] No-w/a /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
380-470MHz Tier [F752011 5172000 30%| s120a.00]  32%| s1.169.60] No-/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450.512MHz Tier [F7520 21 5172000 30%| s1.20a.00] 32%| s1.169.60] No-/a /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
Tier)[F7540 5172000 30%| s120a.00] 32%| s1.169.60] No-/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
WMobile LTE tivoted SIM. (Mid Tier) 1PS01M s7s000] _os|  sseaso|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 1-vear from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
prT ind antenna unit (Mid Ter) [SATI Sasasco| osw| 265875 WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 1-vear from date of purchase Not offered a this time
Section 2.2 - Mobile Data Radio Vehicular UHF or 700/800 NiHz mobile digital data lnk radios
Icom America Inc. - NO 81D } I } } } } I
Section 2.3 - Desk-top Analog & Digital B: tation Radio VHF, UHF, and 700MHz, 806-869 MHz itional, and 700/800 MHz t digital modulatior
- power Tier | F5011 51+ IcT CS120-20A6/1C04 seoa00| 30| saasol WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
~power Tier [ F5021 66 Ush + T C5120-20aG/icoa | ses300] 30| sasz0] WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
136 bile~power Tier [ FS061D + 1CT C5120-20AG/1C09 Stoss00] 30| s7assol wia No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
135 HM-148T inluded (Mid Tir) | FSOG1D RR + ICT C5120-20AG/ic09 | $112500( 30| s7e750] Wi No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly 1-vear from date of purchase. 12003
136 - power Tier [F5121D + 1CT C5120-20AG/1C08 0000 30| s63000[ /A No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase. 12003
136 ~power Tier [ F5220D +1CT C5120-20AG/C04 sops00| 30| searsol  wia No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
136-174MHz IDAS mobile with color display - power supply added (Hiah Tier) | F5400D 01 + 1APS12 $1.195.00| 30% | 836.50 32% $812.60( No- N/A N/A N/A N/A__| Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly 1-vear from date of purchase. 1.20r3
136-174MHz IDAS Tier) | F5400DS 11 + 1APS12 $1.155.00| 30% | 808.50 3% $785.40| No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__| Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly 1-vear from date of purchase. 1.20r3
- power Tier P01 5.+ ICT cs120-20AG/1c08 seoa.00| 30| saza80] WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
~power Tier [ FE021 51+ IcT cs120-2086/1c04 ses300] 30| sasz10]  wia No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
~ower Tier [ F6021 52 + IcT cs120-2086/1c04. ses3.00]  30% 710[ WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
400 bile ~power Tier[F6061D 61+ ICT Cs12020AG/1c08 | $1.06500( 30%| sasso| WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
50 ~power Tier icTc: stoss00] 30| srassol wia No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase. 12003
450 ~power Tier cTC: soo0.00| 30| s63000] WA No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
400 ~power Tier[F6220D 11+ ICT Cs120-20A6/1c04. sops00| 30| searsol  wia No-N/A /A /A /A Mobile 2-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase. 12003
380-470MHz IDAS Tier) | F6400D 01 + IAPS12 1.195.00 30% | 836.50 32% $812.60( No- N/A N/A N/A N/A__| Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly 1-vear from date of purchase. 1.20r3
450-512MHz IDAS Tier) | F6400D 21 + IAPS12 1.195.00 30% | 836.50 32% $812.60( No- N/A N/A N/A N/A__| Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly 1-vear from date of purchase. 1.20r3
380 b Tier [ F6400D5 11 + 1APS12 115500 30| ssosso 3aw|  s7ms.d0] No-wia /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
135 Tien 193500 30| s135a50] 30%| s131580] No-/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
380 Tier [F752011 + 1APST2 193500 30| s135a50] 30%| s131580] No-/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
450 Tier [F7520 21+ 1APS12 193500 30| s135a50] 30%| s131580] No-/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 12003
Tien) 193500 30| s135a50] 30%| s131580] No-/A /A /A /A Mobile 3-vears: Power Supoly T-vear from date of purchase 1203
Section 2.4 - Analog & Digital Personal/Portable Radio Equipment: Various types VHF, UHF, and 700/800 MH: I and trunked
Professional arade license-free radio charaer. (Low Tier) [VIOMR 2s000] sox| Si7so0] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A_[2-vears from date of purchase Not offered at this time
136-174MHz,16 CH no disploy, w Tier) [F1000 RC 26500 s0w| siesso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz, 128 CH, LCD, -key t rapid charaer (Low Tier) [F10005 RC aa700[  sou| saso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-17aMHz, 128CH, LCD, ful DTMF keypod th rapid charaer (Low Tier) [FI000T Re 37700 sow| sx63s0| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz IDAS portable ond no display (Mid Tier) | F1100D AT 42000 30%| s20a00] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
135 e with 128 channels, disploy Mid Ter) [F110005 RC 1000[ 30%|  saszoo|  wa No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz IDAS portable with s, display, full DTMF keypad, Mid Tier)[F1100DT RC c000| 30| 39200 WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450.512MHe, 16 CH, no dsploy, ow Tier) | F2000H RC 26500 s0w| siesso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400470V, 16 CH, no disploy, ow Tier) | F2000L RS 26500 s0w| stesso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450.512MHe, 128 CH, LD, d-key ow Tier) | F20005H RC aa700[ sou| sazso| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MH, 128 CH, LCD, dkey ow Tier) | F20005L RC aa700[ sou| saso| W No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450-512MHe, 128CH LCO, full DTMF ow Tier) | F2000TH RC 37700 sox| sx63s0| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MH, 128CH LCO, full DTMF ow Tier) | F2000TL RC 37700 sox| s263s0| WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450 e with i Tier | F21000H RC sa2000( 30%| s20a00] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
4004700z IDAS portable (SW) with 1 + ropid charaer and no display (Mid Tier) | F2100DL RC sa2000( 30%| s2oa00] W No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MHe IDAS portable with 128 channel, disp id Tier) | F2100DSL RC 1000[ 30%|  saszoo|  wa No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450-5120MH IDAS portable with 128 channels, LCD, fll DTMF keypad. includes ropid charaer (Mid Tie) | F2100DTH RC c000| 30| 39200 WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MHe IDAS portable with 128 channels, LCD. ull DTMF keypad.includes ropid charaer (Mid Ter)| F2100DTL RC c0.00| 30| 39200 WA No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz radio with 1900mAh L on battery & rapid charaer (BC-193) (Low Tier) [F3001 03 R 20200 o[ sarao] W No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
1361740z ATE sofe IDAS portable_(Mid Tier) | F3201DEX 14 S125000 30| sersool  wia No-N/A /A /A /A
136-174MHz IDAS 128 display. Charaer (BC-160) included. (Mid Tier) | F3230DS 13 20.00| 30% | 364.00 N/A No - N/A NIA N/A N/A__|3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1. 2 or 3 additional vears
channe, IDAS
(Mid Tier) | F3261DT 35 RR $880.00) 30% | $616.00 N/A lo - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|3-years from date of purchase Options: 1, 2 or 3 additional years
roof IDAS radio, full DTMF kevpad (Mid Tier)| F3261DT NI sess00 30| seo060| N No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
136-174MHz IDAS portable with disploy: (8p254) included,
separately. (Hiah Tier) | F3400DS 11 $840.00 30%) $588.00 32% $571.20| No-N/A N/A N/A N/A__|3-years from date of purchase Options: 1, 2 or 3 additional years
136-174MHz IDAS portable with 1024 channels, a color display, and full DTMF keypad. Purchase antenna and charger separately.
iah Tier) | F34000T 01 9500|  30%| Sezes0| 32 $608.60| No-N/A /A /A N/A__|3-years from date of purchase Options: 1,2 or 3 additional years
400470V radio with 1900mAh Liion bottery & rapid charaer (BC-195) (Low Tier) [ F4001 03 RC 20200 o[ sarao] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450-512MHz radio with 1900mAh Liion bottery & rapid charaer (BC-195) (Low Tier) [ F4001 43 RC 20200 o[ sarao] W No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MH IDAS 16 channel (BC153) (Mid Tir) [ F42100 01 sass00| s0w| sasos0] WA No-N/A /A /A N/A | 2-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
200-4700H2 1DAS 1. disploy. Charaer (BC-160) included (Wid Tier) |F423005 13 2000 30| s36a00] /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450-512Mtz IDAS 128 channel with disploy._Charaer (BC-160] included (Mid Tier)| 423005 32 2000 30| s36a00] /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
400-470MHz waterproof IDAS radio with GPS, no DTMP keypad (Vid Tier) | F426105 65 0000 30%| sse000| /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
450-512MHz woterproof IDAS radio with GPS, no DTM keypad (Vid Tier) | F426105 50 0000 30%| sse000| /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
roof IDAS radio, full DT keypad (Mid Tier) | F42610T NI-1 as00| 3o|  ssotso|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
roof 1DAS radio, full DTM keypad (Mid Tier) [F42610T NI-2 as00| 3o|  ssotso|  wia No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
350 e with 1024 channels, and o colo displa. y.{Hiah Tier) | FA400DS 11 000 30| sssoo 3|  €571.20] No-w/a /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase (Ootions: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
e with splay v-(Hiah Tie) [ Fa400DS 41 000 30| sssoo 3|  $571.20] No-n/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1.2 or 3 additional vears
380-470MHz IDAS portable with 1024 chanels,a color dsplay, and full DTMF keypod. Purchase antenna and charger separately.
(Hiah Tier) | FA400DT 01 $895.00) 30% | $626.50 32% $608.60| No-N/A N/A N/A N/A__|3-years from date of purchase Options: 1, 2 or 3 additional years
450-512MHz IDAS portable with 1024 channels, a color display, and full DTMF keypad. Purchase antenna and charger separately
(Hiah Tier) | FA400DT 31 $895.00) 30% | $626.50 32% $608.60| No-N/A N/A N/A N/A__|3-years from date of purchase Options: 1, 2 or 3 additional years
IDAS. 512 channels. (Mid Tie 2D $695.00 30% | $486.50 N/A No - N/A NIA N/A N/A__|3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1. 2 or 3 additional vears
517 . 1DAS 512 channels (Mid Tier) | Fs2DUL 5900.00 90000 /A No-N/A /A /A N/A [ 3-vearsfrom date of purchase
IDAS. 512 channels. (Mid Tier) | F62D 11 $695.00 30% | $486.50 N/A No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1. 2 or 3 additional vears
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Discount Discount
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Selection / Product Category Product Number UistPrice _(1-59) _ UnitPrice  (60+) _NetQty Price (VesorNo_Design, Engineering, FSE, etc) NnurN e Fed price (Years/Mos,) Extended Warranty Link for catalogs exceeding 10MB
450-512MHz compact IDAS waterproof portable with 512 channels. (Mid Tier) [F62D 21 Se95.00]  30%]  saseso| | No-N/A A A N/A_|3-vears from date of purchase Options: 1
s 512 channels. parately. (Mid
Tier) | F620UL 11 900,00 /A No-N/A NA NA N/A_|3-years from date of purchase Options: .
45051 ., compact IDAS 512 channels. parately. (Mid
)| Fe20uL 21 900,00 N o . years from date of purchase tions: 1
136-174MHz a full keypad. Purchas 1) | Fron 580,00 32% 074.40] No- vears from date of purchase tions: 1
136-174MHz P25 DM keypad. Purchas 1) | Fro1 65000 32% 122,00 No- vears from date of purchase tions: 1
380-470MHz P: a full keypad. Purchas 1) | Fr0205 11 580,00 32% 074,40 No- -vears from date of purchase tions: 1
450.512MH2 a full keypad. Purchas 1) | F7020s 31 580,00 32% 074,40 No - vears from date of purchase tions: 1
380-470MHz P25 DM keypad. Purchas 1) | Fr0207 21 650.00 32% 122,00 No- vears from date of purchase tions: 1
450-512MHz P25 DTMF keypad. Purchas X 1) | Fr0207 a1 65000 32% 122,00 No- -vears from date of purchase tions: 1
7/sm7M~zP25 partial keypad. 1) | Fr0405 1600.00) 32% 088.00] No- vears from date of purchase tions: 1
7/500 DTMF keypad. ) 67000 32% 135,60 No- vears from date of purchase tions: 1
P lice 1) | 1100 5465.00 WA o~ vear from date of purchase tions: 1
Portable LTE radio with SIM card installed. Monthly airtime fee will apply with activated SiM. 1) | 1PS01H 5610.00 [ o~ vear from date of purchase tions: 1
174 LTE, 1DAS, and andlog. 1) 1P7300 5995.00 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400512 LTE, 104 log UHF portable radi o) [1p7400 5995.00 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Satellite PTT rodi 1) [sAT100 $1,495.00 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
RolP gateway that stems. Deactivated SIM incl hen sita 1) [vepce $3,055.00 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Section 2.5 - Analog & ios: 160 channel, two-piece, VA High-band (150-170 MHz), 450-470 MHz UHF, and 806-869 M, al
Icom America Inc. - NO BID. | | | | | [ | | | | |
1 [ I I [ [ [ [ I I I I
Section 2.6 - Low Power Vehicular Repeater: VH, URF, and 700/800 MHz hicle’s mobile radi i the user's portable radio.
Icom America Inc. - NO 81D | [ | | | | [ | | | | |
1 [ 1 I [ [ [ [ I I I I
Section 2.7 - Mult Band i i i one public safety band.
Icom America Inc. - NO 81D | | | | | [ | | | | |
1 1 [ [ [ [ 1 1 I I
Sectio Fixed Radio Equipment: VHF High-band (150-174 M), URF 450-470 Mz, 700 MHz (746-806 MHe], and 800 M (806-824/851-869 i i i i frequency, or digital modulation.
Icom America Inc. - NO BID. | | | | [ | | | | |
1 1 1 [ [ [ [ 1 1 I I
Section 2.9  Fixed Link Base Radios: VA, UHF, and 700/800 fixed radios for site to site linking.
Icom America Inc. - NO 81D | | | | | | [ | | | | |
1 [ 1 1 [ [ [ [ 1 1 I I
Section. ?
Icom America Inc. - NO 81D | | | | | | [ | | | | |
1 [ 1 1 [ [ [ [ 1 1 I I
adio's
Installation kit to install UCFRS000 into FR5200H/FR6200H [ 96916626 S62. 30%) X WA o~ vear from date of purchase
100 antenna [3310004800 30 30%) 0 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
LTE Antenna | 3310005140 Saa 30%) Y N o~ vear from date of purchase
epeater support bracket (FRI010 & FR5200H) [8930091121 588 30%) ¥ [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adapter cup to installin the BCL19N or BCI21N for the F50/60 MB8 radios [ AD100 $27. 30%) ¥ [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adapter cup for the BCLIIN or BC12IN for the BP210N_BP211 batteries [ AD101 528 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adopter cup for the BCLIIN/BCI21N for the radios with the BP232N/H battery [AD106. 528 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ot 119N or BCIZIN for the BP253 or BP254 batteries | AD110. 528 30%) 9. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
14-pin ACC adopter ose plug accessories | AD118 82, 30%|_s57. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adopter cup that fits into the BC197 12/13 for the BP265 Liion battery [AD121 523, 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adapter cup that fitsinto the BC197 22/23 for the BP232N/H batteries [ AD122 Y 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Adapter cup that fits into the BC214 for the F1000/0 series [ AD130 Y 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
pter that plugs into a 135 543, 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
pter to connect o BNC- 025MA 520 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
to “BNC" 98FSC 522 30%) X [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Antenna (4.5t) for in-vehicle and in-building use | A0 5250, 30%| $175. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
229,999z [ Ati740 52,350, 30%| 51,645 N o~ vear from date of purchase
118-940MHz mountable unity antenna, Field Tunoble, 1/4 WAVE, CHR | ANTENNA 1 18, 30%|_ s10. N o~ vear from date of purchase
144-174Mrz CHR, 59" high | ANTENNA 2 543 30%|__s30. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
450-470Mrz CHR, 40" high | ANTENNA'3 55, 30%|s38: [ o~ vear from date of purchase
152.1620MHz, unity gain antenna, NMO compatible, 21.6" Foctory tuned to 157MHz | ANTENNA 4 520, 30%|_ s1a. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Wireless LAN access point | AP9SM 40, 30%| 5308, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
tuner. [AT140 30%| ss11. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Water repelant. the F70/80 | AW F70 AREA 51 30%| s2a [ o~ vear from date of purchase
e trong metal STUD/SWIVEL KIT 30%|s1a N o~ vear from date of purchase
Swivel clip used with the AW Stud/Swivel Kit. | AW SWIVEL 30%) $o. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger with AD110 installed for F70/80/9011/9021 radios; 100-240V with US style plug | BC119NS 11 30%|_ se6. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
6-Unit Charger Kit BC12IN + AD110 x 6. Requires BC1575 AC adapter. |BCI2INS 30%| 5320, N o~ vear from date of purchase
Straight f 100240V with US style plug [BC1235A 30%) 17. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
AC adapter for trickle chargers; 100-240 with a US style plug |BC1475A 30%|sis. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F50/F60/M8S desktop trckle charger (requires BC-147) [ BC152N 11 30%|__s30. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
AC adapter for the BC12IN/BC197 chargers; 100-240V with US style plug [BC1575 30%] s110. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger for radios with the BPZED/ZaI/ZSZbanery, 100-2401 with o US style plug |BC160 30%| 4o, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
/60 radios; 1002401 with o US style plug |BC190 01 30%| 564 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
for FSH/SHmdraS, 100240V wit 19002 30%|_s50: [ o~ vear from date of purchase
2pid charger for radios with BP265 Li-on bottery. 100 2401 with US style plug [ BC193 30%| a8 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
110 for radios e o e ottey 10713 30%| 5360 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
f with the BP232N/H L ondcps e g 4err Us style plug [BC19723 30%| 5357 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Unit Chamerkrr BC197 + BC1575 + AD128 x 6 for F50/F60/M88 | BC197 3 30%|sa06. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
includes BC-2021P3L rapid charger with BC-1235A AC odapter | BC20IPSAC 30%|__ s50: [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger for the IC-705, 6C-228 adapter or CP-23L cigarette liahter reauired. | BC2021P3L 30%| 46 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
12V/35AA for vz»ca/rmoac 5C2075 30%|_s50 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid rate G-unit charger for radios with the BP271/6P272 | BC211 30%| 5360 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger (includes BC2135A) for rszwusx/dzuwfx BC2126X 30%| so1. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger with a US plug for radios with the BP275/8P280 battery (BC-1235A or BC242 included) | BC213 30%] 4. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger cup for radios with the 8P279 battery (BC-1235 not included) | BC213NAC 30%| 625 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ith US plug A 14 30%| 5360 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
AC with US plug) [BC14-1 30%| 360 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Sixunit charger for SAT100 [BC21NSAT 30%| $320. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Car charger with bluetooth (requires CP22 or CP231) [ BC218 30%| 5147 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Car charger kit 1 each: BC218, CP23L, MBA7, MBF1, HM215 & 5P3s | BC218 Cek 30%| 5343, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger for F52D/F620; 100-240V with a US style plug | BC21ON 30%|__s50. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1t rapid charger; 100-240V with o Us style plug [BC225. 30%|s0a [ o~ vear from date of purchase
< (connect up to 6) and requires the 30225 A ot [EEE 30%|_s53. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Repdchrger at 803 charge (US Plug) [BC227 30%| a8 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘AC adapter for connectable chargers tsczzs&sczuzwa) 5c228 30%|_s50 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Rapid charger with multi adapter for 5AT100 [BC2a1 30%|_s50. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
'AC adopter |BC282 30%]_ s17. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Charqercwdle/wSATIDﬂtarm vehicle and in-building use | BC247 30%| 5204 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Bt A alkaline botteries for the F50/F60 M8 (8226 30%| 635 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.2V 1950mAh, {rvprca!calwclrv/, 1850mAh (minimum value); waterproof [8P227 30%|so0a N o~ vear from date of purchase
ion 00man 250mAh (minimum value) | 8P232H 30%|_s53. N o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.4V 2300mAh (typical capacity), 2250m; mem value) for the nonincendive approved radios | BP232UL 30%|_ $120: [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.4 2300mAh (typical capacity), 2250mAh (minimum value] 1P67 waterproof bottery [BP232WP- 30%|_ s53. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
that holds 6 AAA alkaline batteries (1W output power) [BP240 30%| 625 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
7.2V 1650mAh (typical capacity), 1570mAh (minimum value) [ 89253 30% 77 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.2V 3040mAh (typical capocity), 2900mAh (minimum value) for P25 portables | 8p254 30%| 108 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Battery case that holds 6 A alkaline batteries | BP263. 0% a1 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
WM 7.2V 1400mAn | 8264 30%| 635 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.4V 1900mAh [BP265 30w saa. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.4V 1200mAh 1150 volue) [Bp271 30%|_s70. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Lon 160 2000man 1880 va!ue} 272 30%| 100 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ttery case that holds 3 AA barte 273 30%| 48 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.4V 1900mAh {rvprca!calwclrv/, 0ot (i vlo) v bty [aP277EX 30%| 5280, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.2 1485mAh battery [BP279 30%|__s50. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Liion 7.2V 2280mAh battery [ 8P280 30%]se6. N o~ vear from date of purchase



http://www.icomamerica.com/en/products/landmobile/portables/f52dseries/default.aspx
http://www.icomamerica.com/en/products/landmobile/portables/f52dseries/default.aspx
http://www.icomamerica.com/en/products/landmobile/ipsolutions/ip100h/default.aspx
http://www.icomamerica.com/en/products/network/lte/ip501h/default.aspx
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Liion 7.4V 3210mAh 070mAh (minimurm volue) |8P288 178, N o- vear from date of purchase
20101 290 5107, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
case 5 x A |8P291 550, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
2010mAh Iion intrinsically sofe battery |8P2920C 275 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
3150mAh lion bttery for the F520/F620/M85 | 8p294. S166 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
2350mAh Iion battery for the 5AT100 | 8300 5153, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400-420MHz stubby antenna for the F60/V portable radios | CEN EXD 400 SMI S1a. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Wultisite (conventional only) IP repeter lnk -FR5000 or UCFRS300 board) | CFFR5000 02 570, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Wt ventional & trunking) Frsoooer ucfkssuﬂbaaml [<crersooomT 5995, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ast 1P repeater ink 100) | CFFRS30 1550 N o~ vear from date of purchase
t[crursio0 450, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
12V cigarette lighter cable. ers [CPa3L 538 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Sftwre w/MC |CsF1a 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F1000/2000 series | CSF2000 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Programming software for the F10000/20000 | CsF20000 75, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F3001/£4001 programming software | CSF3001 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F3011/4011 1 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F3021/5021/5011 021/F5021/F5011 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F31010/F5121D series programming software | CSF31010/F5121D 575, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Software to proaram the F3161/4161 F5061/6061 radios 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F32100/4210D, rszsuu/mau rszzuu/szzuu [csF32100 575, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
600 series | CSF3360D/F5360D 590, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Programming software for the ramu/rsmo series [CSF3400D. 80, N o~ vear from date of purchase
F xzzoo/sxzzon 12200 580, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ogramming software | CSF520. 5100, N o~ vear from date of purchase
Cie m/m/n7zx/mzx/rzzzx/rzsz [csFro/¢1700 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
are for the F7010 F7510 P25 radios | CSF7510 5100, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Use o generic USB A to Csa101 580, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1/9511 F9010/F9510 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
/6000 proaramming software | CSFR5000 75, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Programming software for the FR010/9020 | CSFR9010 575 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
H proaramming software [ CSIPS01H 560, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Toader software for F3400/F5400 F7010/F7510 series [ CSKLD2 5600, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Over-the- (OTAP) manager software [csoTPmL 5520, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
P25 over-th [OTAP) manager software; support only conventional mode [csoTPM2 5800, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Prograrm vk [ csrmika 580, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Wmlcwphane adapter to use SM-26 or HM-152 with o PC. Requires BC-1475. | CT23 01 5122 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Lsapled with RErS 0wk it VEPG3) [EER $1.200. [ o~ vear from date of purchase

136-174MHz VHF S0W, 1DAS repear upply. Fsite
conventional. | Y5300 2,765, N/ No-N/A NA NA N/A_|1-year from date of purchase

400-470MHz UHF S0W, 1DAS repeater, . trunking, mult-site trunking,
ondsimlesst covention. R 2,765, N/ 1-year from date of purchase

450-512MHz UHF S0W, 1DAS repeater, . -site Ulmkmy,
2,765, N o- year from date of purchase
531 N o~ vear from date of purchase
5680, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
5656 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
S11. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
510, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
510, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
525, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
5215 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ne-touch antenna for docking 5495 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
136-150MHz antenna for the £50 M88 handhelds (Blue ring) 13, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400 13, N o~ vear from date of purchase
13, N o~ vear from date of purchase
50 49aM~muabyamema/ar F60/V portable radios (red rina) 18, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Hz flexible antenr 18, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1517174Mﬁ4nmmcrdanrennatan‘heFSﬂ M8 (red ring) S5 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
150-162MHz stubby antenna for F50/V (Red ring) 18, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
160-174MHz stubby antenna for F5O/V (areen ring) 18, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
148160 M flexible antenna - standard on F011 18, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
530 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
450-520Mz antenna for F60/V (blue ring) 13, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
380-520MHz cut ant 530, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
380-4301 2. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400 4500 st Y [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1361500 2. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
136-150MHz st Y [ o~ vear from date of purchase
430- 2. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
450-430Mz st Y [ o~ vear from date of purchase
148-162MHz antenna for F3400 2. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
a5 1620 sy atenna Y [ o~ vear from date of purchase
470.5201 2. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1601741 522, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
160-174MHz stubby antenna for F34( 10, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400-430MHz antenna for LM portables s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
136-150MHz antenna for LM portables | FASC25V. s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400-450M e stubby antenna J type connector [FASC26US 15 N o~ vear from date of purchase
136-144MHz stubby antenna type connector | FASC26VS 15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
142-150MHz stubby antenna type connector | FASC2IVS 15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
142-162MHz antenna J type connector | FASCaBV. s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
it e e oo [ s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1461 nnector | FASCS5V. s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
xsu1suM~muabyamema/rypemnmm 56V 15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
430-470MHe standar onnector [FASC57U s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
xsowmmmabyamema/rypemnmm 5705 15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
'380-520MHz cut antenna J type connector for desired | FASC1UC $10. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
aswmmmmmtarm desired | FASCEIVC $10. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
150-1600 type connector [FASCG2V 556, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
155-165MHz high goin antenna Jtype connector [ FASCG3V 556, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
-512MHz antenna I type connector | FASC72U s13. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
4504700z stubby antenna for J type connector | FASC73US 15 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
VHF Wideband 136-174MHz (GAL 06026 5100, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Earphone/mic with 2-pin right 520, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
with earphone jack (5-pin) S50, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
: 50 132, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Self S68. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
112, N o~ vear from date of purchase
Standrd. 548 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
DTME 592 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
5130, N o~ vear from date of purchase

c (right angle 2+

speaker) 48, /A No-N/A NA NA N/A_|1-year from date of purchase
speaker) 80, N o- year from date of purchase
Lorge speaker micre and metal alqator lp (54 596 ¢ WA o~ vear from date of purchase
Lopel mic with i 5200, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Lopel mic with K 5200, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Earphone microphone with 2-pin right 555 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
icrophone with tw 5100, [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ophone. 5143 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Waterproof speaker mic (5-pin) s115 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
rproof speaker mic (9-pin) 5148 N o~ vear from date of purchase
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Waterproof HMIE3LS o vear from date of purchase
14-pin oud waterproof speal HM184H o vear from date of purchase
HM184UL o vear from date of purchase
< rophone with earphone jack HM186LS o vear from date of purchase
F101 able)[HI192 o vear from date of purchase
Hand microshone fo the £8101 | 1103 o vear from date of purchase
Blue spea £3201DEx/420106X | 2035 o vear from date of purchase
veo the 8C-218 cor charger [HM215 o vear from date of purchase
120 [Hm216 o vear from date of purchase
Microphone with buit-in speaker and front panel includes up/down butons and two programmable buttons (P1/P2) [H217 o vear from date of purchase
Secondary remote control COMMANDMIC, for the F54000/F6400D. Requires AMIKS + OPC2373 or OPC2374. | HMI218 o vear from date of purchase
avy duty microphone (1P54) fo the F5400 seres [M220 o vear from date of purchase
Heavy duty microphone with DTMF keypad (1P54) for the F5400 sries [ 22t o vear from date of purchase
WMicrophone (1PS5) for the F5400 seres | HM221 o vear from date of purchase
WMicrophone with DTME keypad (1PS5) for the F5400 series [ HM221T o vear from date of purchase
HM222 o vear from date of purchase
(14-pin connector) [HM2221 o vear from date of purchase
Commandic with 10-ey 175 for P01 Hz30rE o vear from date of purchase
s misophne v R o vear from date of purchase
Compar HM236 o vear from date of purchase
Mobile microph e or oo e [iMaes o vear from date of purchase
the FR9010/3020 repeaters [ HM-9000 o vear from date of purchase
3. H-HOTIGWP. o vear from date of purchase
Lor . right angle 2-pinscrew down connector) [HMIHD717WP o vear from date of purchase
over Allows for full-duplex operation and requires the OPC-2353. | Hs102 o vear from date of purchase
Earpiece headset; use with V51/0PC2004/0PC2006/0PC1352 [ 54 o vear from date of purchase
Earhook headset with b with 2.in screw down connector for hands:free operation. |HSO4LIWP o vear from date of purchase
Headset with boom mic; use with VS1/0PC2004/0PC2006/0PC1392 [ HS95. o vear from date of purchase
Behind.the-head type with boom microphone with 2-pi screw down connector [ HS95LWP o vear from date of purchase
oo i oct i hesder, s with V51 OPCALOA/OPC200/0PC1352 o vear from date of purchase
vy duty vehicular chorger | IABC1019 o vear from date of purchase
ey iy v e o o e s [ B o vear from date of purchase
Remote mounting kit for the £9511/F9521 dual head kit Duol head,
required. 1A-DH1095 o year from date of purchase
Heowy duty phone with loud audio, & 40+ hours of talk time (charger included) | IAHME00 o vear from date of purchase
MKS or RMKY that. to connect 2 0PC2367 together for 521t of cable | 1AJB1001 o vear from date of purchase
Coble to wire the F5400/F6400 to an external speaker [1A0PCO54 o vear from date of purchase
USB to micro-UsB 3t coble [ 1AOPC1003 o vear from date of purchase
z le-to-
female adapter. | IAOPC1075. No-N/A /A /A N/A_|1-year from date of purchase.
kevic IAKVLL cable. le adapter. |1AOPC1076 o vear from date of purchase
Power suoly withcovrfor contol saton (130VAC. 1 [Abs o vear from date of purchase
e sl ons cover o e 7501 sarioom [sts o vear from date of purchase
FR010/5020 [1AS ANTRLY-D o vear from date of purchase
s FR9010/9020 | AS ANTRLY-S o vear from date of purchase
ROSSBAND CONTROULER o vear from date of purchase
WTSW1 o vear from date of purchase
Dual ontenna WTSW2 o vear from date of purchase
oc. 12/24VDC with remote power control and SNMP. It can up t0 12 loads [IASDP1001 o vear from date of purchase
36-148 6 cavity 50W. z oUP1001 o vear from date of purchase
148.160 6 covity 50W/ c oUP1002 o vear from date of purchase
160174 6 covity 50w cl 0UP1003 o vear from date of purchase
136-148 6 covity 50W c oUP1004 o vear from date of purchase
148-160 6 covity 501/ cl 0UP1005 o vear from date of purchase
160174 6 covity 50W c 0UP1006 o vear from date of purchase
136148 6 cavity 50W. 1 cl 0UP1007 o vear from date of purchase
148160 6 cavity 1 c DUP1008 o vear from date of purchase
160-174 6 cavity SOW internal duplexer, 1 z DUP1009 o vear from date of purchase
144-190MHz 6 cavity 100W duplexer with 3WHz minimum TX-1 DUP1010 o vear from date of purchase
144-174MH2 6 cavity, 350W duplexer, 400kHz T tal | ASDUP1012 o vear from date of purchase
152175z 50W internal duplexer for the FRS000 or CY5000. DUPLOLS o vear from date of purchase
400.512 4 cavity 100W c 0UP1035 o vear from date of purchase
400440 6 cavity 50W. c 0UP1036 o vear from date of purchase
4404706 cavity 50W cl 0UP1037 o vear from date of purchase
4704906 covity s0W z 0UP1038 o vear from date of purchase
190-512 6 cavity 50W cl 0UP1039 o vear from date of purchase
4406 cavity SOW | 1 z oup o vear from date of purchase
e sconty s 1 c oup o vear from date of purchase
0.490 6 cavity 501 1 c oup o vear from date of purchase
22 oy sow e s z oup o vear from date of purchase
140-512 6 cavity 100W duplexer with z oUP; o vear from date of purchase
C¥5000/6000 internal duplexer assembly kit inclu P o vear from date of purchase
FR5000/6000 inernal duplexer assembly kit including RF DUPSOFR o vear from date of purchase
440.470MHz 100W 2RU power ampifier; 1 1 y [aseapasos o vear from date of purchase
470-430MHz 100W 2RU power amplifer; 19 rack mountable; requires 13.8V power supply | IASE2PASO7 o vear from date of purchase
750 100 200 o poer apfle (1 et 055254507 n o [DEEIEISHE o vear from date of purchase
Site inverter 300W 12/24VDC; 1RU 19" rad 0 vear from date of purchase
Syem e estr Ky (SOMK, S8 Dore v £ 7500ASK 725 Avarce syt 16y A5 onsse oo e
P25 the “P25 System Key Request Form” by the P25 Trunking
System owner | SKE7P No-N/A N/A /A N/A_|1-year from date of purchase.
tem Key o
ner to proaram | IASKE7S o year from date of purchase
Internal universal use to mount into FR5000/FR6000 [IASMNT1005 o vear from date of purchase
2619, 16U desktop 2.postrack; 35016 INT1028 o vear from date of purchase
30 (178U locking indoor cabinet [|ASMINT1030 o vear from date of purchase
4219 welded steel 2-post rack; 24U, 1,500lb INT1042 o vear from date of purchase
46 (26R0) cabinet [IASMNT1046 o vear from date of purchase
(34RU) locking indoor cabinet | IASMINT1060. o vear from date of purchase
63x19 welded steel Z-post rack; 63U, 1,500lb INT1063 o vear from date of purchase
4219 welded steel 2 1,500 INT1070 o vear from date of purchase
204 power supy 1or2 INT1100 o vear from date of purchase
2R ok met o 204 e s s s o2 s e INTL102 o vear from date of purchase
ids 1102 INT105 o vear from date of purchase
T TS o, 500 40 pove e 5 4510 o vear from date of purchase
152-162VHz 100W out, 2-5W in, 4RU power amplfier; 19" rack 4520 o vear from date of purchase
450.512MHz 100W out, 2-5W in,_4RU 19" rack-mountable [IASPAS50 o vear from date of purchase
136-1500 #5000 [ 1ASPR1001 o vear from date of purchase
150-174N 15000) | 1ASPR1002 o vear from date of purchase
00-4401 6000) [1ASPR1010 o vear from date of purchase
440-5201 6000) [1ASPRI01L o vear from date of purchase
FR5000/6000 internal pre-selector ossembly kit including RF jum et ond screws | IASPRSOFR o vear from date of purchase
T 1105 o vear from date of purchase
20 power supply 13.8YDC; requies trayfor use in rack (1ASMNT1102) o vear from date of purchase
110V power supply_cabinet for control station use on P25 radios o vear from date of purchase
110 e spo F5011/5021/F5121/F5220 o vear from date of purchase
110V power supply F5061/6061 o vear from date of purchase
511HT] 0 vear from date of purchase
Heavy duty speaker mic w/3.5mm accessory jock (2+ o vear from date of purchase
Heavy duty use speaker mic (5:pin] o vear from date of purchase
X Jack o vear from date of purchase
Manages up to 100 A o vear from date of purchase
1P based PC o vear from date of purchase
e £9011/9511 seres radios [ 15 o vear from date of purchase
Add 25kHz into the radio i o vear from date of purchase
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Discount Discount Service
ffered  NetSingle Offered Included Service Type Senvice Warranty OEM
Selection / Product Category Product Number_ ListPrice  (1-59)  UnitPrice  (60+) NetQty Price (YesorNo Design, Engineering, FSE, etc.) Hourly Rate Fixed Price (Years/Mos.) Extended Warranty Link for catalogs exceeding 10MB
30% $252. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
30%| $136. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
30%| 5294, N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
AES. AES in re ISL-P2SAES 30% $252. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
P2: £ 30% $122. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Front, 30%| $231. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
P25 Phase 2 - 30%| 5294, N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
P25 Phase 1 ISL-P25TR 30%| $350.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
P25 conventional voting scan license | ISL-P25VS 30%| 584.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Enable 25kHz in the F7010/F7510 radios 30%| $3.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Tvpe le and multi-site trunking 30%| $87.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
2-Wire Kit D-Ring Earloop for F50/F60 | KLEIN DOUBLE AGENY S8 30%| $49.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
55-160MHz antenna | LAIRD EXH 160 30%| $18. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
151-163MHz helical % wave antenna center tuned to 157MHz. .ARSEN smumsmc 30%) $18. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
1000/2000/D non display radios 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
belt loop and cutout y for the F10005/20005 rmmss 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
the F1000T/2000T with a swivel loop. L000TS 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case with swivel belt loop and D-ring; display cutout for the F3400DS F70105 | LCF1035SW_ 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
; display & for the F34000T & F7010T | LCF10365W_ 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case with swivel belt loop and D-ring for the F520 | LCF10525 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather carrying case with a swivel F14/24 F3011/4011 radios | LCF14 SWIVEL 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather carr the F3001/4001 F3101D/41010 radios. )00 SWIVE 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
r carrying case with a metal swivel clip and cutout for the display | LCF3021S SWI! 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case for the F3161/4161 F3061S SWI! 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case for the F3161/4161 lt clip 61T 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
for F3261 | LCF3261S SWI! 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
and cutout for the. DTMF keypad for F3261 series | LCF3261T SWi! 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case with a metal clip and DTMF the F70/80 series radios. | LCF70 CLIP 30%| $31.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather case with a belt loop for the F70/80 series radios. Case is not IS approved with any of our IS radios. | LCF70S LOOP. 30%| $26.6 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
ut F9011S SWIVEL 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Leather cc the F9011T/9021T radios with a full keypad cutout 9011T SWIVEL 30%| $35.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
for VEPG3/1P1000C VP3 30%| $70.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Standard belt clip for F9011 series 115 30%| $7.0 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Alligator type bel clip | MB124. s12.25]  som] s8. N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
for F8101 [ MB126 s300.00]  30%|  saso. N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
io | MB127 sisso|  son|  siac N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
130 ssac0|  son|  ssa N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Alligator 133 si7.50]  sou| s N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
ligator type belt clip [ MB135 s1025] 3o%] N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Swivel belt clp for F1000/F3400/F7010/F520/M8S series | MB136 s15.05]  sou| s N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
of radio | MBS6 s13.00]  sox] N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
uB93 s1.2s] sox] N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Vligator belt clip | MBS s1075] so%] N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Blue alligator belt clip for rsztnufx/dzuwfx BIAEX. s17.00]  sox| s N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
‘Alligator belt ci angles the body | MB94R. sso| 3ow| s N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Jse with standard belt clip. |MB96N. s3o0| 3ow| s N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
the F50/60 M8 | MB98 s13.05] sou] . N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
/EPG3/1P1000C | MB99A se5.00|  3ow| sas: N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Bracket adapter for the BC-218 | MBAT. sa0.00  so%|  sasc N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Standard belt clip [ M883 s1625]  sow|  su: N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Belt clip for SAT100 | MBBS. $15.00] 30%| $10. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Remote Requires MBAS, MBA7 or MBAS. | MBF1 $87.00] 30%| $60.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
. Covers all HF bands from 1.5 to 30mhz. One 15m antenna comes.
standard. | MN100L 5460, 30% N/A| o - year from date of purchase
NMO Permanent Mount, 17t RG58 cable, PL259 connector | MOUNT 1 $23. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Trunk Lid Mount/HD, BRKT, 45 DEG CBL, 58A/U PL259 | MOUNT 2. $38. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Black Magnetic Mount - 3 1/4. 12ft RG58 cable w/PL259 connector | MOUNT 3. 545 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
‘micro SD card | MSD CARD. $30. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Nylon case with a clip for the IP100H/IP501H | NC100H $25. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Nylon case with a clip for the IP100H/IPSO1H. $25. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
clip for the F1000/2000/D non display radios | NCF1000C $27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
the display F10005/20005 $27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
$27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Nylon case with metal clip with display cutout; FidDGDS/WHIHS $27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
$27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
$27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
$27. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Nylon case with a loop for the F31615/41615 radios without a DTMF cutout $25. 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
for the DTMF keypad for F3261 series $27. 30%| . N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
or the F9011T/9021T radios with a full keys INCF9011 $30. 30%| 521, N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
PC JSB connector. | OPC1122U $101. 30%| $70. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
DCpawer cable (9. Sﬂi wrm 2-pin T connector. | OPC1132 546, 30%| $32.: N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
P25 mobile radios | OPC1532 $42. 30%| $29. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase_
1721/2721/D series mobiles. F7L7/SL7/D portable radios | OPC1533 588 30%| $61.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
er cable for P25 radio to KVL3000/4000. For portables: requlles UPC -1871, RI45 female to RI45 female & 8920001690. For
RIS tema!e & 8920001690. | OPC1534 5230.00 30%| 161.00 N/A No-N/A N/A N/A N/A__| 1-year from date of purchase_
0/80/D. OPC1536 $123.00, 30%| $86.10 N/A, No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|1-vear from date of purchase_
usB. dios w:m 14-pin connector | OPC1862 $192.00, 30%| $134.40 N/A, No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|1-vear from date of purchase_
tween two 14-pin connector OPC1870 $125.00, 30%| $87.50 N/A, No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|1-vear from date of purchase_
D 15
key loading on the F7010 portable series [ 0PC1871 112.00]  30% N/A| o - year from date of purchase
D-Sub 15-pin ACC coble. Connects with a PC, line or vehicle horn | 0PC1939. $97.00]_ 30%| N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
power cord for F9511HT | OPC1962 $60.00] 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Adam‘erplna ra to use the HS94/95/97 for the F3001/4001/3101D/4101D V80 | OPC2004 $27.00] 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
97 for the F1000/0 products | OPC200LA $27.00_30%| N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
Aacprer ‘lug with VOX and no PTT to to use with the H594/95/97 | OPC2006LS. $35.00]_ 30%| N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
D-Sub 25-pin ACC cable. Connects with a PC, I, ignition sense line or 078 $95.00] 30%| N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
cable pCaze
radios) | 0PC2144. 30%) $25.20| /A No-N/A N/A N/A N/A_|1-year from date of purchase.
F8101 Cloning cable | OPC2204 30%| $140.00 N/A, No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|1-vear from date of purchase_
USB connector for ID51A/ID31A/5100A/7100 | OPC2218LU 30%| $53.90 N/A, No - N/A N/A N/A N/A__|1-vear from date of purchase_
between the VEPG3 and the F5061/D series or A120 (RJ-45 speaker plug). |OPC2275 $153. 30%| $107. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
tween the VEPG3 and the HM152/SM26 {Modular /ack connector with speaker jack) | OPC2276 $220. 30%| $154. N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
ernal modem conne 1308 $175. 30%| $122.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
Antenna tuner control cable for ATIW/AHNIHOI F8101 (10M or 32.8ft) | OPC2309 $175. 30%| $122.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
‘Adapter plug with PTT to to use with the H594/95/57 | OPC2328. 5102, 30%) $71. N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
14-pin prog tronsparent data transfer | 0PC2338. 5239, 30%|  S167. N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
Type-C NXDN transparent data transfer for F53600/4360D | OPC2: 5135, 30%) 594 N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
01M prograr 1357 $175. 30%| $122.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
PIT 1359 $82. 30%| $57.4 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
-pin to 10-pin DIM) $100. 30%| $70.( N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
10-pin DIM programming cable | OPC2 5112, 30%) 578. N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
1.9 IK5/RMK7 | OPC2 $61. 30%| 542 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
IK5/RMK7 | OPC2 564 30%| 5445 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
IK5/RMK7 | OPC2 569 30%| 548 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
IK/RMK7 | 0PC2367 583, 30%) 558, N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
Hm218 [OPC2373 563, 30%) 544, N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
Hm218 [OPC2374 $97. 30%) 567 N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
g serial device w/R5232 | 0PC2389. 585, 30%) 559 N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
VEPGA to FR5000/6000 | 0PC2390. 30%| 102, N/A] o~ -vear from date of purchase
Cable ting VEPGA to FR5000/6000 | 0PC2390. 30%| 6142 N/A] o~ -year from date of purchase
UB for the IPSOIM 407 30%| 571 N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
between VEPG4 & SAT100 | OPC2412 30%| $81.¢ N/A, lo - -vear from date of purchase
SAT100 and AH40. | OPC2422 30% | $117. N/A| lo - -vear from date of purchase
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Discount Service
ffered Netsingle Offered Included Service Type. Service Warranty OEM
Selection / Product Category Product Number (60+) _Net Qty Price (Yes or No_Design, Engineering, FSE, etc.) _Hourly Rate Fixed Price (Years/Mos.) Extended Warranty Link for catalogs exceeding 10MB
w 429 N o- vear from date of purchase
high power output [opCasL [ o~ vear from date of purchase
M/F) (16.4ft) [OPCAS0 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
UsB, 780C [ o~ vear from date of purchase
c PC515L [ o~ vear from date of purchase
pCE07 N o~ vear from date of purchase
PC608 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
1.9 pCE09 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Accesory cable for e Co17 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
it [ opCsar N o~ vear from date of purchase
'DC power cable for qang charger [0PCES6 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
remote mounting kits [0PC726 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
FR9010/5020 rep: 9000 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
USB programming. adios with 9-pin connector | OPCI66U [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Interface Cable with RJ45 Connector between P25 mobiles KA KVL125 | OPCIAKVLL [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Interface Cable with 14 Pin C between F9011/F9021 KA KVL125 | OPCIAKVLIE [ o~ vear from date of purchase
2-Wire pal cable) with 9-pin connector [OTTO V110822 WA o~ vear from date of purchase
fine p nector) [OTTO V410514 N o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Explorer lightweiaht heads w/boom mic (2-pin right [oTT0 Vaexaccs [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Noise fite to use with the FSO61D with the UT-1A100 already installed. [PWLF- [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Remote C Software + CT-24 unit - each IDA: 1cr-24) [Rersit [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F1721/1821 bracket face plote included [ o~ vear from date of purchase
F5061/6061 bracket face plate for remote m included N o~ vear from date of purchase
F9511HT. Requi cable. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
racket face plate for remote mounting for the F5400D/F64900. cluded. N o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Remote mount kit for the F8101 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
for the F5400D/F5400D. microphone notincluded. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Add 3.1 RR firmware to your IDAS radio. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Access point manage [ o~ vear from date of purchase
-283/284. Can connect up to 30 BC-225 chargers to it [ o~ vear from date of purchase
are for IDAS MuliTrunk [ o~ vear from date of purchase
$IM card for U.5. LTE netuw [ o~ vear from date of purchase
or switch for mobil radios [ o~ vear from date of purchase
for 1PS0IM [ o~ vear from date of purchase
e for F5400 series [ o~ vear from date of purchase
carphone HM-163MC/HM-153LS [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Acoustic tube earphone with a clip (3.5mm) [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Earhook type earphone with HIV-163MC/HM-153LS [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Earhook type earphone with [ o~ vear from date of purchase
20w [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Tube adapter for use with the EH-158 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
3.5mm speaker jack and. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
[ o~ vear from date of purchase
QD acoustic tube (9, 3.5mm Lishape) |SP-ATL [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ciqarette adapter for the F3161 F3261 series | SS BC61 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
ciqarette adapter for the F3400 F7010 series |55 BC62 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Trunk (1 per repeater) [UCFRS300 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
136-174MHz analog/digital 1DAS repear URFRS300 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
450-512MHz Repeater module [ URFRE3 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
400-470MHz Repeater module [URFRE300L [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Non- Up. Wot compatible with 7-110.[UT109 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Up 01020 (255 4 groups) codes available. [UT110 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
P25 upgrade board for F70/80 handhelds |UT120 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
25 Hardware Uparade Board - Mobiles | UT120 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
fan do. T2 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
“AES/DES ith OTA 5011/F9511 series | UT125 N o~ vear from date of purchase
FIPS 140.2 AES ith OTAR compliance for F9011/F9511 series | UT125 FIPS N o~ vear from date of purchase
FiPs 140.2 ISL-P2SAES license key to activate AES | UT125 FIPS-2 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
6.25KHz digital module for old PLL versions of the F3161/4161 or F5061/6061 radios [ UT126H 0 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
'DES encryption for F3011/F9511 radios | UT128 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
AES/DES quires ISL code to activate AES [UT134 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
FS0610 with RR i included i price) [ UTIAT00 N o~ vear from date of purchase
GPS antenna [ Uxaa1 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Gps unit [Uxa48 [ o~ vear from date of purchase
LTE speakerphone unt |VESPL [ o~ vear from date of purchase
VOX/PTT case with 2-pin ight andle connector. Must use with Hs34/t595/Hs97 [ V1L [ o~ vear from date of purchase
VOX/PTT case with 14-pin connector. Must use with H594/H595/H597. |VSTMC [ o~ vear from date of purchase
VOX/PTT case with 5-pin connector. Must use with H594/H595/H597. |VS1SC [ o~ vear from date of purchase
Compact lapel PTT Bluetooth with earphone w/3.5mm jock [VS3. [ o~ vear from date of purchase
PIT switch 1594/95/97 [VSalA [ o~ vear from date of purchase
‘Cable with heavy duty PTT swith with 14-pin conector. Use with Hs94/H595/1597. [VSaMC [ o~ vear from date of purchase
VOX/PTT switch cable to use with headset (H594/95/57) | VSSMC N o~ vear from date of purchase
‘America 2-way Radio's
o WA o~ N/A
or site) [ o~ N/A
Authorized Dealer Support [ o~ N/A
program your land mobile mainframe- file o 1.t [ o~ N/A
adio or 1AS product ( [ o~ N/A
'ENGRAVE Engraving for radios | ENGRAVE WA o~ N/A
1 year extended warranty for a total 3 years [ o~ N/A
2 year extended warranty for a total 4 years [ o~ N/A
v 5 years [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
v [ o~ N/A
, [ o~ N/A
1 year extended warranty for a total 3 years [ o~ N/A
2 year extended warranty for a total 4 years [ o~ N/A
3 year extended warranty for a total 5 years [ o~ N/A
Tuning fee for duplexers [ o~ N/A
Installation for Avionics [ o~ N/A
Installaion for Marine [ o~ N/A
cabinet [ o~ N/A
ortable [ o~ N/A
Icom t0 pr [ o~ N/A
com to program your mobile or portable. [ o~ N/A
IONICS [ o~ N/A
Marine | PROGRAMMING MARINE [ o~ N/A
Comprehensive Repair IDAS 3yrs | QRRSO1 [ o~ N/A
vrs | QCRRS09 [ o~ N/A
Engineering support - per hour |QENG-PH. [ o~ N/A
nsite Technical/Field Support 15t Day | QFS-10 [ o~ N/A
Onsite Technical/Fig QFsAD [ o~ N/A
per hour | QFS-PH [ o~ N/A
Wetwork Phone Support -per hour |QNSH [ o~ N/A
QPPR-EA [ o~ N/A
et up fee per desian plote | QPPR-SU [ o~ N/A
24/7/365 Phone Support | QTT-24S.0 [ o~ N/A
24/7/365 Phone Support | QTT-2495.1 N o~ N/A




Selection / Product Category Product Number

List Price

On-Site Technical Training 1t Day, Up to 6 People [ QTT-0510
On-Site Technical People |QTT-05AD.

Technical training from their desk | QTT-0SPH

Hourly rate for custom systems builds | SERVICE/SALE BUILD-UP IAS.

Discount
Offered
(1-59)

Net single
Unit price
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Discount Service
Offered Included Service Type. nice Warranty OEM
(60+) _Net Qty Price (Yes or No_Design, Engineering, FSE, etc) Hourly Rate Fixed Price (Years/Mos) Extended Warranty Link for catalogs exceeding 10M8
[ No-n/a] /A [ wa [ wa | /A I N/A
["No-n/a /A | wa [ v | /A | N/A
["No-n/a /A | wa [ v | /A | N/A
[No-n/a] /A [ wa T v | /A | N/A

3.0 Digital Microwave Terminals

Icom America Inc.-NO BID | T I I I I I I
4.0 LVRB: ion Ant

Icom America Inc. -NO BID | [ [ [ [ [ [ I
40

Icom America Inc.-NO BID | T I I I I I I
50

Icom America Inc. -NO BID | [ [ [ [ [ [ I
6.0 Generators

Icom America Inc.-NO BID | T I I I I I I
7.0_Back-up Batteries

Icom America Inc. -NO BID | [ [ [ [ [ [ I
50

Icom America Inc.-NO 61D | T I I I I I I
9.0 Service

Icom America Inc. -NO BID | [ [ [ [ [ [ I
100 ird-party Oversight

Teom America . o8]




	MASTER

